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SP0300-03-D-V900 Page 2 of 7
Milk and Ice Cream Products
Northern California Zone

Group Hlil: DLI Monterey, CA and NAS Lemoore, CA

Unit
Supplies/Services Quantity  Unit Price Total
76. Milk, Whole, 1/2 PT CO 12,576 12 PT $0.13 $1,634.88
ltem #: 119
77. Milk, Whole, 6 GL CO 6,492 GL $1.77 $11,490.84
Container Price: $10.62
item #: 103
78. Milk, Low Fat, (1%), 6 GL CO 7.806 GL $1.69 $13,192.14
Container Price: $10.14
tem #: 170
79. Milk, Skim, Non Fat, 1/2 PT CO 15,428 12 PT $0.11 $1,697.08
ltem#: 248
80. Milk, Skim, Non Fat, 6 GL CO 10,116 GL $1.46 $14,769.36
Container Price: $8.76
tem # 240
81. Milk, Chocolate, Reduced Fat, (2%), 64,560 12 PT No Bid No Bid
1/2 PT CO
82. Milk, Chocolate, Low Fat, (1%), 1/2 1,000 12 PT $0.13 $130.00
PT CO
tem #: 228
83. Milk, Chocolate, Low Fat, (1%), 6 GL 7,104 GL $1.74 $12,360.96
CO
Container Price: $10.44
ltem #: 204
84. Eggnog, Low Fat, QT CO 254 QT $0.89 $226.06
ltem #: 255
85. Buttermilk, Cultured, 1/2 PT CO 30 12 QT $0.11 $3.30
ltem #: 238
86. Sour Cream, Cultured, Min 18% MF, 6,410 LB $0.71 $4,551.10
51.B CO

Container Price: $3.55
ltem #: 352



SP0300-03-D-V900
Milk and Ice Cream Products
Northern California Zone

Group lll: DLI Monterey, CA and NAS Lemoore, CA

Supplies/Services Quantity
87. Sour Cream, Cultured, PT CO 1,104
item #: 356

88. Cheese, Cottage, Chilled, Low Fat, 15,050

Creamed, Small Curd, 5LB CO
Container Price: $4.90
tem #: 511

89. Cheese, Cottage, Chilled, Creamed, 4,730
Small Curd, 5LB CO
Container Size: $5:25

item #: 512

90. Yogurt, Assorted Flavors, Low Fat, 95,832
1/2 PT CO

ltem #: 10428

91. Ice Milk Mix, Vanilla, For Milk Shakes, 960
12 GL CO

ltem #: 318

92. Ice Milk Mix, Chocolate, For Milk 1,008
Shakes, 1/2 GL. CO

ltem #: 319

93. Ice Cream, Regular, Vanilla, 10% MF, 60
3GLCO

Container Price: $9.33 ltem #: 4540

94. Ice Cream, Regular, General, 10% MF, 120

Chocolate, Fruit, Nuts, or other Bulky
Flavors, 3 GL CO

Container Price: $9.33

ltem#: 14540

95. Ice Cream, Regular, Vanilla, General, 364
10% MF, 3 OZ Cup

Container Price: $4.80

ltem #: 4769

Unit

PT

LB

LB

12 PT

172 GL

1/2 GL

GL

GL

Dz

Unit
Price

$0.75

$0.98

$1.05

$0.39

$1.27

$1.49

$3.11

$3.11

$2.40
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Total

$828.00

$14,749.00

$4,966.50

$37,374.48

$1,219.20

$1,501.92

$186.60

$373.20

$873.60



SP0300-03-D-V900
Milk and Ice Cream Products
Northern California Zone

Group lli: DLI Monterey, CA and NAS Lemoore, CA

Supplies/Services Quantity  Unit

96. Ice Cream, Regular, General, 10% MF, 284 DZ
Chocolate, Fruit, Nuts, or other Bulky

Flavors, 3 OZ Cup

Container Price: $4.80

tem#:. 14769

97. Ice Cream Sandwich, Vanilla, 200 DZ
w/Chocolate Wafers

Container Price: $5.36

ltem #: 4752

98. Ice Cream, Sandwich, Neopolitan, 750 DZ
w/Chocolate Wafers

Container Price: $5.36

item #: 4755

99. Ice Cream Cone, Preformed 1,212 DZ
Container Price: $8.66
ltem #: 4741

100. Sundae Cups, Assorted Flavors, 1,560 DZ
30ZCup

Container Price: $4.80

ltem #: 14769

101. Sherbet, Regular, 3 OZ Cup 100 DZ
Container Price: $4.80
ltem #: 4789 /4776

102. Ice Cream, Taco Bar, Chocolate & 680 DZ
Vanilla, Individually Wrapped

Container Price: $14.22

ftem #. 4878

103. Drink, Fruit Flavored, Grape, 1/2 PT 30,360 112 PT
CcO
ltem #: 416

104. Drink, Fruit Flavored, Orange, 1/2 PT 30,690 1/2 PT
CcoO
Item #: 417

Unit

Price

$2.40

$2.68

$2.68

$4.33

$2.40

$2.40

$7.11

$0.06

$0.06
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Total

$681.60

$536.00

$2,010.00

$5,247.96

$3,744.00

$240.00

$4,834.80

$1,821.60

$1,841.40



SP0300-03-D-V900
Milk and Ice Cream Products
Northern California Zone

Group lll: DLI Monterey, CA and NAS Lemoore, CA

Supplies/Services

105. Drink, Fruit Flavored, Fruit Punch,
12 PTCO

item#; 415

106. Juice, Orange, Chilled, Concentrate,
1/2 PT CO

ltem #: 449

107. Juice, Grapefruit, 1/2 PT CO

108. Yogurt, Plain, 1/2 PT CO
ltem #: 428

109. ice Cream, Chocolate, 3 GL CO

Quantity

33,660

46,960

10,000

1,032

100

Container Price: $9.81 Iltem #:. 4501

110. Ice Cream, Chocolate Chip, 3 GL CO

100

Container Price: $12.18 ltem #: 4510

111. lce Cream, Cookies & Cream, 3 GL
CcO

Container Price: $14.61

ltem #: 4524

112. Ice Cream, Mint Chocolate Chip, 3 GL

CcO
Container Price: $14.61
ltem #: 4521

113. Ice Cream, Chocolate Chip Cookie
Dough, 3 GL CO

Container Price: $14.61

ltem #: 4509

114. Ice Cream, Rocky Road, 3 GL CO
Container Price: $14.61
tem #: 4503

115. lce Cream, Pralines & Pecans,
3GLCO

100

100

100

100

100

Unit

12 PT

12PT

12 PT

12 PT

GL

GL

GL

GL

GL

GL

GL

Unit
Price

$0.06

$0.21

No Bid

$0.39
$3.27
$4.06

$4.87

$4.87

$4.87

$4.87

No Bid
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Total

$2,019.60

$9,861.60

No Bid

$402.48

$327.00

$406.00

$487.00

$487.00

$487.00

$487.00

No Bid



SP0300-03-D-V900
Milk and lce Cream Products
Northern California Zone

Group llI: DLI Monterey, CA and NAS Lemoore, CA

Supplies/Services Quantity  Unit
116. Sherbet, Rainbow, 3 GL CO 100 GL
Container Price: $9.42

ltem#: 4554

Estimated Total Dollar Vaiue for Group lll:
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Unit
Price » Total

$3.14 $314.00

$158,364.26

POC - Where Orders are to be Placed: Chris Mannzo (Order Desk)

Phone (Voice) Number for Order Placement: 559-264-6583
Facsimile Order Placement Number: 559-264-6471

Delivery Schedules
Location Time of Delivery
DLI Monterey, CA

Combs Hail 5:30 AM - 11:00 AM
Bldg. 627
DLI Monterey, CA

Belas Hall 8:00 AM - 11:00 AM
Bldg. 838
DLI Monterey, CA

MWR 8:00 AM - 11:00 AM
Child Development Center

Bldg. 7693

Monterey RD.

POM - Annex, CA

Porter Youth Center 8:00 AM - 11:00 AM
Bidg. 4283

North - South RD.

POM - Annex, CA

Frequency & Limitations

Five (5) Deliveries per Week:
Monday through Friday

Five (5) Deliveries per Week:
Monday through Friday

Two (2) Deliveries per Week:

Tuesday & Thursday

Two (2) Deliveries per Week:
Tuesday & Thursday



SP0300-03-D-V900
Milk and lce Cream Products
Northern California Zone

Group lil: DLI Monterey, CA and NAS Lemoore, CA

Delivery Schedules
Location Time of Delivery
NAS Lemoore, CA
Main Galley 8:00 AM - 11:00 AM

Bldg. 860
NAS Lemmore, CA
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Frequency & Limitations

Two (2) Deliveries per Week:
Tuesday & Friday

POC @ Prodcuers Dairy Foods Inc for Invoice and Payment Problems:

Ken Klapste (559)457-4614

Places of Performance under the subject contract:
Plant Item #
Producers Dairy Foods Inc 76-116

250 E. Belmont Ave.
Fresno, CA. 93701

Code

1622



